
Join us in a marathon benefit concert in support of relief efforts for typhoon "Ondoy" victims. 

(See *Project Objectives below)

Joining us are the following performing artists who are donating 100% of their time and talent to 
this wonderful cause:

Florante de Leon
Ms. Kevyn Lettau
Bernardo Bernardo
Louie Reyes
Cesar de la Fuente
Mon David
Jet Montelibano
Fe de los Reyes
Joni Feliciano
Jannelle So
Tateng Katindig
Ner de Leon
Patricia Javier
Michael de Mesa
Djhoanna "Gigi" Garcia
Ms. Pinky De Leon
Jessica Casas
Fulton Montoya
Maricar Cabasag
Kit Navarro
Cory Key
Malou Toler
Ciamara Morales
Ava Johnson
The Asian Dolls
Sarah Lazatin
Daryl Ogalino
Gabriel Lambirth
Reginald Johnson
Ellona Santiago
Dion Santos
Claire Rodriguez
Edd Evidente
Abe Lagrimas, Jr.
Odette Quesada
Bodjie Dasig
Eddie Coligado
Mon Concepcion
Aaron Concepcion



Michael Walker
Bong Paderna
Cleer Band
Anapolis Band
Lou Sabas
Miguel Vera

"HANDOG SA BAYAN" is presented by Creative Concepts International

Directed by Jet Montelibano

XOOM.COM, an online money transfer company, will be on hand to process "fee-free" online 
donations transmitted directly to the Philippine National Red Cross. 

MANILA FORWARDER, a local cargo company, will ship "free of charge" all in-kind donations 
collected on site. (If you prefer to donate in-kind, please see below **List of Suggested Items)

Participate in a Silent Auction and bid on the many wonderful items courtesy of our generous 
donors and sponsors.

We will invite representatives from the following foundations to speak about relief efforts they 
are undertaking:

- ABS-CBN Foundation / Sagip Kapamilya
- Ayala Foundation
- GMA Kapuso Foundation

Donations to the above foundation groups will be received and acknowledgment receipts shall be 
issued. A tally of collected funds will be announced periodically throughout the concert.

We will also invite a representative from the Office of the Philippine Consulate General of Los 
Angeles to speak about relief efforts and directives from the Philippine government.

Admission is free but donations are welcome. 

Seating is limited at the Celebrity Centre. 

To receive priority entry, please reserve your admission tickets by sending an email to 
CreativeConceptsIntl@gmail.com with the subject line "Oct 11 Ticket Request." Our email reply 
will provide you with instructions as well as driving directions to Celebrity Centre. 

Part 1 of the show will run from 4:00 pm to 6:00 pm. 

Part 2 of the show will run from 6:30 pm to 8:30 pm
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There will be a 30-minute intermission for refreshments at onsite concessions and to allow 
attendees to participate in the Silent Auction. You are welcome to donate items for the auction. 

Members of the media are all welcome! Please proceed to our Media Check-in desk upon arrival.

Staff volunteers needed! 

Doors open at 3:30 pm. See you there!

Thank you to Xoom.com, Manila Forwarder, ABS-CBN Foundation & Sagip Kapamilya, Ayala 
Foundation, GMA Kapuso Foundation.

We also thank Ms. Ruchika Kohli and Julian King of Xoom.com, Manny Paez of Manila 
Forwarder, FilAmNation, Bote Multimedia, Balita, Regina Pinol of Walker Foods Inc., and our 
volunteers and supporters for for their invaluable help. 

For additional information on HANDOG SA BAYAN, visit our website at 
www.CreativeConceptsIntl.com

~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~
**PROJECT OBJECTIVES

1. The primary purpose of this event is to raise awareness about the calamity that has struck the 
Philippines on September 26, 2009, when typhoon "Ondoy" aka "Ketsana" slammed the country 
and caused massive flooding, expansive devastation and death. Within a 6-hour period, Ondoy 
pounded the country with a month's worth of rain forcing people to seek refuge on their rooftops 
and to swim in neck-deep flood waters, while cars and property were washed away in ravaging 
waves. The flooding wrought major damage that more than one week after the tragedy struck, 
many folks, from all social classes, are without water, electricity, food, clothes, medicine, and 
basic needs. Due to limited resources, thousand are cramped in evacuation centers still waiting 
for relief and assistance, while many homes are still unaccessible due to the thick mud, murky 
waters, and debris preventing flood waters from completely subsiding. People, especially 
children and the elderly are suffering. The situation is dire and we need to do our share in helping 
alleviate the devastation and loss to many people in our country who already had very little to 
begin with.

2. This event is aimed at providing an opportunity for the various foundations and organizations 
to speak about their ongoing relief efforts so that civic-minded individuals and groups may know 
where and how to make donations to legitimate causes and receive reassurance that these efforts 
are truly worthy of support.

3. This event also aims to assist in the appropriate channeling of donations. For those who wish 
to donate to the Philippine National Red Cross (PNRC) we have sought the assistance of 
Xoom.com, an online money transfer company who will provide onsite laptop computers with 
internet access to allow attendees to donate directly from their bank account or credit card to 

http://www.CreativeConceptsIntl.com
http://www.CreativeConceptsIntl.com


PNRC without paying any transmission fees. For in-kind donations, we have sought the 
assistance of Manila Forwarder, in shipping to the Philippines "free of charge" any in-kind 
donations collected onsite from attendees.

**LIST OF SUGGESTED IN-KIND DONATIONS:

CLOTHING: t-shirts, towels, sandals, underwear, also blankets, light sleeping bags

FOOD: canned foods, instant noodles, biscuits, no perishable items please

MEDICAL: pain-relievers like Tylenol, ibuprofen, paracetamol, multivitamins, cough and cold 
medicine, first aid kits

OTHERS: Baby stuff & feminine/sanitation products: wipes, diapers, sanitary napkins, hand 
sanitizers, soap, inflatable beds


